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"IMPORTANT"

TEMNMDER NOTICE

PUBLIC NOTICE

Possession Notice (For Immovable Property) Rule 8-(1)

ISOLVERE LIFE TECHNOLOGIES PRIVATE LIITED

[SpONSor: Camama M N}

Trannfrdmp Dreaar sove M

Rules, 2002

ninety seven thousand only)

Distt- Ghaziabad, U.P 201001

NORTH : Plotno 11
EAST : FlatnoB-4
Encumbrances: NIL

. e = o SN Tl R, 2 . - ~ak, - . | Notice is h : hat the followi h fM/s E K Limi Whereas, the undersigned being the Authorized Officer of IIFL Home Finance Limited (Formerly known as India Infoline Housing
Whilst care is taken prior to b | MAME () WAME UF WORK SOTICE TESDER OFENING DATE | AMOUST ) LAID| WEBSITE OF | SODAL G F M Bk otice is hereby given that the following shares of M/s Escorts Kubota Limited are Finance Ltd.) (IIFL-HFL) under the Securitisation and Reconstruction of Financial Assets and Enforcement of Security Interest Act
acceptance of advertisin Mo | BRABETL ORI CLOSENG BATE | | APPRII 1N HE WA D DO TALCT stated to have been lost/misplaced or stolen and the registered holder(s)/applicant(s) 2002 and in exercise of powers conferred under section 13(12) read with Rule 3 of the Security Interest (Enforcement) Rules 2002,
P. . _g WLTEE TSI B FEES CRE AL TH s TEn eI has /have applied for issue of duplicate share certificate(s): a Demand Notice was isslued by thelAuthorised Officer of the company to the Borrower/Co-Borroyvers mentioned herein belpw to
copy, itis not possible to verify = : i - ! ! — — - . repay the amount, notice is hereby given to the borrower and the public in general that the undersigned has taken possession of
its contents. The Indian HiFCC SUPPLY AMD INSTALLATHN OF ALUTOMATI 0,05, 224 T CIRORES i e o - Share holder Certificate No's Distinctive No's Qty the property described herein below in exercise of powers conferred on him under Section 13(4) of the said Rules. The borrower
Express (P) Limited cannot FIRD SUPFRESSION SYSTER | AFSS) WITH 24 (TR mepriy | o oo i . in particular and the public in general are hereby cautioned not to deal with the property and any dealings with the property will be
b F; Id r( ) nsible for h ROVED 100 (CLEAN AGENT SUTMERSINS Name(s) / Folio no From To From To subject to the charge of IFL HFL for an amount as mentioned herein under with interest thereon."The borrower's attention is invit-
© te i espo fS' © cl) suc EVeTEM]  POR.  ELECTRICAL M) 605163 - 605164 | 27594429 - 27594478 | ed to provisions of sub-section (8) of section 13 of the Act, If the borrower clears the dues of the "IIFL HFL" together with all costs,
contents, nortforany loss or ’ ; EH Y b ; Hleri _ charges and expenses incurred, at any time before the date fixed for sale or transfer, the secured assets shall not be sold or trans-
damageincurred as aresultof ERETALLACEE TN LT o B L0 P | | | Séasnég% 533"6(;4/ g?gggg i g?ggg? 30831009 - 30831058 | 200 ferred by "IIFL HFL" and no further step shall be taken by "IIFL HFL" for transfer or sale of the secured assets.
transactions with companies, FOR FURTHER INFORMATION KINDLY VISIT : www harvanaeprocurement.eov.in or www etenders. hry.nic.in 1364571 33844429 - 33844478 Name of the Description of the Secured Asset [Total Outstanding| Date of | Date of
associations or individuals | |ra 26454 HEY 65705726 - 65705775 | Borrower (s)/ (Immovable Property) Dues (Rs.) _[Demand| Possessi
advertising inits newspapers — - - Co-Borrower(s) [All that piece and parcel of Plot No 5A, Block 4, Shree ved| Rs.8,06,543/- | Notice | on
or Publications. We therefore Any person(s) who has / have any claim in respect of such aforesaid equity shares must Mr. Monu, |city, Sehdevpur Road, Ahmadpur, Grant Bahadrabad,| —(Rupees Eight e "
) mmend ;[h { reader lodge claim in writing with the Company within 15 days from the date of publication of Mrs. Prachi, Harldwar,. Uttarakhand, .Indla, 249402. Area Admeasuring |Lakh Six Thousand Mar- Jur;-
ecomme atreaders this notice otherwise Company shall cancel the original share certificate(s) and issue (Prospect No. | (In Sq ft: Property Type: Land_Area, Saleable_Area, Super| Five Hundred and | oo, | 5504
make necessary inquiries . o : . IL10161150) |_Built_ Up_Area Property Area: 456.00, 456.00, 456.00. Forty Three Only)

. . duplicate share certificate(s) to the registered holder(s) / applicant(s). Sd/- . : — —_ .
before sending any monies . . ol For, further details please contact to Authorised Officer at Branch Office: 2nd floor, Sant Bhawan, Ranipur Road, Arya
or entering into any Place: Delhi, NCR . (Sapjay Sikri) Nagar, Jwalapur, Haridwar-249407 or Corporate Office: Plot No.98, Phase-IV, Udyog Vihar, Gurgaon, Haryana.
agreements with advertisers Date: 07.06.2024  H No. 41, Pocket-22, Sector-24, Rohini, New Delhi-110085. |  [Piace: Delhi, Date: 07-06-2024 SdJ- Authorised Officer, For IIFL Home Finance Ltd.
or otherwise acting on an
advertisement in any e
manner whatsoever. i 5 CAN F I N H o M Es LT D-

h CIN: L85110KA1987PLC008699
CanFin Homes Ltd

Office No.-02, 2nd Floor, Plot No.-B-1, Kasana Tower Alpha-1,
Commercial Belt Greater Noida, UP-201308 Mobile No. 7625079164,
0120-4569974, E-mail: greaternoida@canfinhomes.com

APPENDIX-IV-A [See proviso to rule 8(6)]
Sale notice for sale of immovable properties

E-Auction Sale Notice for Sale of Inmovable Assets under the Securitisation
and Reconstruction of Financial Assets and Enforcement of Security Interest
Act, 2002 read with proviso to Rule 8(6) of the Security Interest (Enforcement)

NOTICE is hereby given to the public in general and in particular to the Borrower (s) and
Guarantor (s) that the below A property mortgaged/charged to the Secured Creditor, the
physical possession of which has been taken by the Authorised Officer of Can Fin Homes
Ltd., Greater Noida Branch, will be sold by holding e-auction on “As is where is”, “As is what
is”, and “Whatever there is” on 12/07/2024 for recovery of Rs. 34,07,535.00/- (Rupees
Thirty four lakh seven thousand five hundred thirty five only) due to Can Fin Homes Ltd.
from Mr. Anil Kumar Sachdeva S/O Jiven Dass Sachdeva And Mrs. Sangeeta Rani
Sachdeva W/O Mr. Anil Kumar Sachdeva (Borrowers), and Mrs. Sadia Khan D/O
Asadullah Khan (Guarantor) as on 06.06.2024, together with further interest and other
charges thereon. The reserve price will be Rs. 1970000.00 (Rupees Nineteen seventy
thousand Only) and the earnest money deposit will be Rs.197000.00 (Rupees one lakh

DESCRIPTION OF THE PROPERTY
Flat No B- 6, Second floor, Plot no 10, Khosla apartments, Shalimar Garden Extension-1,

BOUNDARIES OF THE PROPERTY ARE AS UNDER
SOUTH : FlatnoB-5
WEST : Flatno B-8

The detailed terms and conditions of the sale are provided in the official website of Can Fin
Homes Ltd., (https://lwww.canfinhomes.com/SearchAuction.aspx).
Link for participating in e-auction : https://sarfaesi.auctiontiger.net

Date: 06.06.2024
Place: Greater Noida

Authorized Officer, Can Fin Homes Ltd.

Sd/-
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CIN: L85110KA1987PLC008699

thousand Only).

NORTH: FlatNo FF-3
EAST : Open Plot
known encumbrances, if any-Nil

‘s>  CAN FIN HOMES LTD.

C :: He - Office No.-02, 2nd Floor, Plot No.-B-1, Kasana Tower Alpha-1,
Fin Led Commercial Belt Greater Noida, UP-201308

Mobhile No. 7625079164, 0120-4569974

E-mail: greaternoida@canfinhomes.com

APPENDIX-IV-A [See proviso to rule 9(1)]
Sale notice for sale of inmovahle properties
E-Auction Sale Notice for Sale of Inmovable Assets under the Securitisation and
Reconstruction of Financial Assets and Enforcement of Security Interest Act, 2002
read with proviso to Rule 9(1) of the Security Interest (Enforcement) Rules, 2002
NOTICE is hereby given to the public in general and in particular to the Borrower (s)
and Guarantor (s) that the below A property mortgaged/charged to the Secured
Creditor, the physical possession of which has been taken by the Authorised Officer of
Can Fin Homes Ltd., Greater Noida Branch, will be sold by holding e-auction on
“As is where is”, “As is what is”, and “Whatever there is” on 26/06/2024 for
recovery of Rs. 3885673.00/- (Thirty eight lakh eighty five thousand six hundred
seventy three only) due to Can Fin Homes Ltd. from Mr. Pravesh Kumar S/O
Rajendra Prasad and Mr. Rajendra Prasad S/O Ram Chauhan (Borrowers), and
Manoj Sharma (Guarantor) as on 06.06.2024 together with further interest and other
charges thereon. The reserve price will be Rs. 1100000.00 (Rupees eleven Lakh
Only) and the earnest money deposit will be Rs. 110000.00 (Rupees one lakh ten

SCHEDULE OF THE MORTGAGED PROPERTY
Flat No FF-4 (RHS Back Side), 1st floor plot no 16, 17A, 17B &18 Khasra no 1473,
Balaji Enclave Raispur, Dasna Ghaziabad-201002
BOUNDARIES OF THE PROPERTY ARE AS UNDER
SOUTH:: Other property
WEST : Road 25ft, Wide

The detailed terms and conditions of the sale are provided in the official website of
Can Fin Homes Ltd., (https://www.canfinhomes.com/SearchAuction.aspx).
Link for participating in e-auction : https://sarfaesi.auctiontiger.net

Date: 06.06.2024
Place: Greater Noida

Authorized Officer, Gan Fin Homes Ltd.

Sd/-

FEFORM NO ITNC-Z&6™ |
[Pursuant to Rule 30 the Companies
{Incorporation) Rules, 2014]
Bafare he Canlral Governmand
Ragianal Ditactar, Nestharm Ragion
In e malter of i Sub Saclion 4 of Seclion
13 of Companles Act, 2013 and Claus |a) of
Zub ruleld] of Rule 30 of the Campanies
(ncarparation) Rudes, 2014
AND
In' the matier of

[(GIN : UZT100DLI01GPTC2EATSD)
Having it regesbered office al C-104 Kavan Agpls
Wiaknanda, Kalkay, South Delhi, Delhi-1100148, India

Paldioder
Molice is heraby gvan o the General Pubdic that
ihe compary priposes fo make application io
dhia Canlral Governimand ndor sactan 13 af the
Lampanies Al 203 seaking conlismalan of
mitaraton of e Memorandum of Association of
fhe Comgany i lems ol the specigl rasalutan
passed at the Exira ordinary general meeting held
an 63062024 o enshle the company o change
s Registered CHiice fram “WET of Delhl™ 1o
{“State of Haryana"

Ay persan whose inbarest s likety 1o ba affecied
fy the proposed change of ihe registared pffice
jaf fhe company may daliver edher aritha MCA-21
gorta! (awvw, mea.gav.in) by Bling inseslor complaint
Horm or cause b be delivered or sand by ragistarad
ipcest of histhar objeclions supporied By an affidait
siating e matura of hisfer inberest and grouncs
al dppoesition Lo the Ragignal Diraclar al he
address Reglonal Director, Morthern Regian,
B-2 Wing, 2*Flocr, Paryavaran Bhawan, CG0
Compdex, Mew Dalhl, within Fourzen days from
fthe date of publicaban of this nolice with & copy
wf the appécant company 81 ils registered cffice
lat the sddrazs mentiarad bedow:

C-104 Kavar Apots, Alzknanda, Kalkajl,
South Delhi, Dedhi-110018, Indis,

[For Solvere Life Technolagies Private Limited

Sdi-
Dated ; 05062024 Makul Goel
‘Flace : New Dalhi Director

| DIN : D2455751
Addrags | B-T98, Green Field Colony Surajkund,
Sector-43, Faridabad-121003, Haryana

Textile (Prospect

4. Shree Dayal |

Bid Increase Amount
Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty

“|New Delhi - 110059

Twenty One Lakh Fifty Six
Thousand Nine Hundred

Rs.1,80,400/- (Rupees One
Lakh Eighty Thousand Four

No IL10143123) | Five Thousand Only) ~ |(Area ad Measuring 432 Sq. Ft.) Thirty Two Only) Hundred Only)
1. Mr. Narender |15-May-2023 & Rs.23,44,897/- |All that part & parcel of the property Built Up 2nd 20-Oct-2023 Rs.20,18,000/-
Kumar (Rupees Twenty Three Lakh |Floor front side without roof rights , Built on Plot No. [ Total Outstanding as On (Rupees Twenty Lakh
2. Mrs. Hema Forty Four Thousand Eight {150, Carpet Area Ad Measuring 360 Sq. Ft., and Date 03-May-2024 Eighteen Thousand Only)
Verma Hundred Ninety Seven Only) |Built Up Area Ad Measuring 450 Sq. Ft., Khasra| Rs. 28,90,557/- (Rupees |Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)
3. Krishna Clinic Bid Increase Amount No. 25/16/2 . Block P, Situated in the area of Village | Twenty Eight Lakh Ninety Rs.2,01,800/- (Rupees Two
(Prospect No | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty |Razapur Khurd , Colony Known as Mohan Garden, | Thousand Five Hundred | Lakh One Thousand Eight
IL10317139) Five Thousand Only) Uttam Nagar, West Delhi, Delhi, 110059. Fifty Seven Only) Hundred Only)

possession within 7 days, otherwise IIFL-HFL shall not be responsible for any loss of property under the circumstances.

-

the amount already paid will be forfeited (including EMD) and the property will be again put to sale.

-

pute in tender/Auction, the decision of AO of IIFL-HFL will be final.
15 DAYS SALE NOTICE UNDER THE RULE 9 SUB RULE (1) OF SARFAESI ACT, 2002
The Borrower are hereby notified to pay the sum as mentioned above along with upto dated interest and ancillary expenses before the date of
Tender/Auction, failing which the property will be auctioned/sold and balance dues if any will be recovered with interest and cost

Public Notice For E-Auction Cum Sale (Appendix - IV A) (Rule 8(6)) 1. Mrs. Ananya | 11-Apr-2023 & Rs.24,32,970/- All that part & parcel of the property Built Up First 14-0ct-2023 Rs.20,96,000/-

Sale of Immovable property mortgaged to IIFL Home Finance Limited (Formerly known as India Infoline Housing Finance Ltd.) (IIFL-HFL) Corporate Office Bharti (Rupees Twenty Four Lakh |Floor (Front Side-Lhs) Without Roof Rights, Built™ Total Outstanding as on | (Rupees Twenty Lakh Ninety

at Plot No.98,Udyog Vihar, Phase-1V,Gurgaon-122015.(Haryana) and Branch Office at:- "2nd floor, Sant Bhawan, Ranipur Road, Arya Nagar, Jwalapur, | 2. Mr. Prashant | Thirty Two Thousand Nine on Plot No. 100A and 100B, Carpet Area 477 Sq.|  Date 03-May-2024 | Six Thousand Only)

Haridwar - 249407 "/ Office No 1, First Floor, Mahaluxmi Metro Tower, Plot No. C -1,Sector - 4, Vaishali, Ghaziabad, Uttar Pradesh - 201010/ Plot Verma Hundred Seventy Only) |Ft., Super Built-Up Area 531 Sq. Ft., out of Khasra| Rs. 28,02,514/- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)

No.98,Udyog Vihar, Phase-IV,Gurgaon-122015/ 30/30E, Upper Ground Floor, Shivaji Marg, New Delhi - 110015/ 316 - Purnima Plaza,Second floor,GMS -| (Prospect No Bid Increase Amount | N0.328, Situated In The Revenue Estate of Village| - Twenty Eight Lakh Two | Rs.2,09,600/- (Rupees Two

Road,Dehradun -248001/ "Unit number 309, 3rd Floor, Padam Business Park, Sector 12 A, Awas Vikas Sikandara Yojna, Agra-282007"/ 3rd Floor, Pari | 1L10302540) | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty |Nawada, Delhi State, Colony Known As Bhagwati| Thousand Five Hundred |  Lakh Nine Thousand Six

Palaza Radhika Vihar Mathura -281004/ "E-370, 2nd Floor, Nirman Vihar, Delhi-110092/ A-1C A-1D, 2nd floor, Noida Sec16, Noida, Gautam Budh Nagar - Five Thousand Only) ~ |Garden Extn., Uttam Nagar, New Delhi-110059 Fourteen Only) Hundred Only)

201301 . under th"e S?curltlsatlon and Reconstruction of Financial Assets and Enforcement of Security Interest Act, 2002 (hereinafter "Act’). Whereas the [~ ;- Jaina | 20-Dec-2022 & Rs.6,37,385/- | All that part and parcel of the property bearing 04-Mar-2023 Rs.9,85,000/-

Auhorized Officer ("AO") of IIFL-HFL had taken the possession of the following property/ies pursuant to the notice issued U/S 13(2) of the Act in the follow- Panwar (Rupees Six Lakh Thirty | Khasra No -975 Ka, Land Area 800 sq. ft.,[ Total Outstandin (Rupees Nine Lakh Eight

d . ! . 3 ) ) g ason p gnty

ing loan accounts/prospect nos. with a right to sell the same on "AS IS WHERE IS BASIS, AS IS WHAT IS BASIS AND WITHOUT RECOURSE BASIS" for | 5 s Suppi Seven Thousand Three Mauza- Nawabgarh, Pargna Pachvadhun,|  pate 03-May-2024 Five Thousand Only)

realization of [IFL-HFL's dues, The Sale will be done by the undersigned through e-auction platform provided at the website: www.iiflonehome.com " Devi Hundred Eighty Five Only) | Tehsil Vikas Nagar, District Dehradun,| Rs.7,89,126/- (Rupees |Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)
Borrower(s) / Demand Notice Description of the Inmovable Date of Physical Reserve Price (Prospect No Bid Increase Amount | Uttarakhand, India, 248001 Seven Lakh Eighty Nine | Rs. 98,500/~ (Rupees Ninety

Co-Borrower(s) / Date and Amount property/ Secured Asset Possession Rs. 62,60,000- IL10224643) | Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty ) Thousand One Hundred Eight Thousand Five
Guarantor(s) 09-Aug-2021 Al that part and parcel of the property Plot No 2, 07-Oct-2023 (Rupees Sixty Two Lakh Sixty Thousand Only) ( Carpet Area ad Measuring 744 Sq. FT) Twenty Six Only) Hundred Only)

1. Mr. Shivendra ',Qf' 5%2&1;1/- (tRquhees Fifhy Khasra No 1602 ,Pandey Wala Jwalapur | Tota[; Ct)utggaﬁdingo 2af on Thousand Only) 1. Mr. Vipin | 21-Jan-2023 & Rs.23,15,705/- 73" tha:t paBrt and paFglcetl ﬁf t%% prg%erFtly BuilBt Uﬁ ' 18-Sep-2023 Rs.19,40,000/-
Prakash Yadav ine Lakh Twenty Thousan ' i ate 03-May- : Kumar, 2. Mr. | (Rupees Twenty Three Lakh | Property Bearing Plot No 60, 3rd Floor Bac i Rupees Nineteen Lakh

2 Mrs.Asha Yada- | One Hundred Eleven Only) ?f;g"'sv:rﬁ Uttarakhand, 249407, admeasuring| o - ~6519 561/- (Rupees Earnost Money Deposit |y an Arora (Rupees Tenty Tree 21 | side Rght Hand Side, With Land Area Ad T°taé,§‘;t3t3‘f',\',f2;_%ozaf On (Fofty Thousand Only)
vm, MrPrakash [~ Bid Increase Amount - Sixy Five Lakh Ninteen | - (EMD): Rs. 826,000 f -5 "y gy Hundred Five Only) |Measuring 450 Sq.ft. And Built Up Area Ad| Rs, 28,50,315 /- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)

IFoot“ve%q(géggfect Rs.50,000/- (Rupees Fifty TfKJudsaSr)dt Fi(\ge Hgnclir;ed ( uSpiieTShoB(s aﬁ d Onvlvygn Y| Arora, 4. Teste Bid Increase Amount \I\;I_ﬁasurirlllg 1t80(l) Sl\jll'f:{’ thsr?j No. g?/zll 'Yl”;‘ Twenty Eight Lakh Fifty | Rs.1,94,000/- (Rupees One
o Thousand Only) na oixty Une Only Stories(Prospect| Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty | VIlage nastsal, Monan Garden, Block K-2,| Thousand Three Hundred | Lakh Ninety Four Thousand
1 Mr. Satir | 26-0ul-2022 & Rs.34,39,546]- [All that part and parcel of the propery bearing 14-Jun-2023 Rs.29,22,000/- (Rupees | No IL10188544) | Five Thousand Only) | Uttam Nagar 110059. Fifteen Only) Only)
Singh (Rupees Thirty Four Lakh |PlotNo. C-17 & C-18, (As per Site Flat No. TF- | Total Outstanding as | Twenty Nine Lakh Twenty 1™y o ooono™123-Nov-2022 & Rs.13,20,654)- | All that part and parcel of the property bearing| 28-Jul-2023 Rs. 18,00,000/-
2 Mrs.Sapna Thirty Nine Thousand Five |2, Third Floor), Khasra No. 96M, area admea- | on Date 03-May-2024 Two Thousand Only) 2 MrNarain | (Rupees Thirteen Lakh Twenty | Property No.52, Ugf ,Area Admeasuring 497 Totai Outstanding as On | (Rupees Eighteen Lakh
(?rosbec?No Hundred Forty Six Only) |suring No. 127 Sq. Mtrs, Krishna Garden, | Rs. 47,45,775/- (Rupees |Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)| Sihgh Thousand Six Hundred Fifty” [ Sq.Ft. Carpet Area,585 Sq.Ft. Saleable]  pate 03-May-2024 Only)
828415) Bid Increase Amount | Govind Puram, Ghaziabad, Uttar Pradesh, | Forty Seven Lakh Forty Five | Rs.2,92,200/- (Rupees Two Four Only) Area,Gali No. 2, Ram Chander Enclave, Rs, 1743662/~ (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit
Rs.40,000/- (Rupees Forty |India, 201002 (Area Ad.Mesauring: 699 | Thousand Seven Hundred | Lakh Ninety Two Thousand | (p N : Mohan Garden, Uttam Nagar, New Delhi- Ntee
Thousand Only) Sq.ft) Seventy Five Only) Two Hundred Only) (||_r1°0s1pz%c7t27;) Bid Increase Amount 110059 Sﬁ\( ent%_ehn LakhdFé)rty (EMD)
: Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twent . ree Thousand Six Rs. 1,80,000/- (Rupees One
1 Mr. Rakesh 27-Nov-2019 & Rs.20,65,815/- |All that part and parcel of the property Plot 09-Oct-2023 Rs. 21,38,000/- (Rupees Five Th o(usa% d Only) ¥ ( Area ad Measuring 527 Sq. Ft) Hundred Sixty Two Only) | Lakh Eighty Théusgnd Only)
N Rk (Rug_ees_r'rl']wenty I(.jaé(h hSt|Xty No.4, area admegsuirng .165 Sq_. Yds. Ou_t of | Total Outstanding as Tl\é\(e?]tty_r%)ne Laléhghlwty 1 NI Mahendra |15-Feb-2023 & Rs.17,71.646)-| All that part and parcel of the property PIot 08-5ep-2023 Rs.12,49,000-
2 Mrs. Asha g 'V% dog.?ta” Cl)gl Khasra No.664, Situated in the village Loni, In | On Date 03-May-2024 ight Thousand Only) Singh,2.M'S | (Rupees Seventeen Lakh | House no.5SM/NA/39, Land Area 1035 sq. ft.,Total Outstanding as On | (Rupees Twelve Lakh Forty
(Prospect No undred Fifteen Only) |6 ahadi of Vikes Nagar, Paragana Loni | RS:383:43,495/- (Rupees  (Eamest Money Deposit (EMD] | vear 3. Mrs.| Seventy One Thousand Six | Carpet Area 510 q. ft., Built-Up Area 680 Sa. Date 03-May-2024 Nine Thousand Only)
853457) Bid Increase Amount 0. /- District Ghaziabad, Uttar Pradesh- |, iy Eight Lakh Forty | Rs.2,13,800/- (Rupees Two | “yynni'Deyi | Hundred Forty Six Only) | ft., Super Built-Up Area 880 sq. ft, on Khasra| Rs. 22,909,969/~ (Rupees |Eamnest Money Deposit (EMD)
Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty , Three Thousand Four Hun |  Lakh Thirteen Thousand 4. M. Viipin Bid Increase Amount no.39 situated at Nagla Albatiya Tehsil and Twent); Two Lakh Ninety | Rs. 1,24 900}{ (RE ees One
Five Thousand Only) 201102. -dred & Ninety Five Only) Eight Hundred Only) Kurﬁar(ﬁrospect Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty | District Agra Uttar Pradesh, India, 282001)  Nine Thousand Nine Lakh Zl'wénty Four 'FI)'housand
1. M}r(. Sanjeev %éhr:)%\é-gOFZif%einRsL-;ﬁﬂi?nSJtly- g\llzt/r;%t Szrt f;?dt pirﬁeltof the pr?perty bgaring — 025t-<:ct-§923 5 (Rup;sé- ;gffigoﬁ ety No IL10101166) Five Thousand Only) | (Area admeasuring 777 sq. ft.) Hundred Sixty Nine Only) Nine Hundred Only)
umar - a Flats T-Huts , carpet area admea-| Total Qutstanaing as On - o E—r

2. MrDeepanshu| ~ Seven Thousand Nine | uring 167 sq. ft. Raghubir ﬁagar Najafgarh| _ Date 03-May-g024 Four Thousand Only) 1. Mrs. Savita |21-Dec-2022 & Rs.23,07,859/- éllgthﬁgpgggng aE)(;’:lkrcgild(()ef tggcpz)rrc])geFrltgot;ea,\lgllrég 18-Jul 2.023 " Rs'1l%l"86’tOOOI-L @

3. Miss.Deepika | Hundred Fifty One Only) . Rs. 19,52,998/- (Rupees [Earnest Money Deposit (END) Savita | (Rupees Twenty Three Lakh | Tl ’ Lo 0r, M1, Total Outstanding ason | _(Rupees Nineteen La
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount Road, Delhi, India-110027 Nineteen Lakh Fifty Two | Rs.1,02,400/- (Rupees One |, 2- Mr. Kapil Seven Thousand Eight | Built-Up Area 750 sq feet, with roof right, Plot| *pate 03-May-2024 Eighty Six Thousand Only)

857676 & | Rs.25,0001- (Rupees Twenty |(S2leable Area ad Measuring 237 Sq. Ft) | Thousand Nine Hundred | Lakh Two Thousand Four |3 Savta Traders| Hundred Fity Nine Ony) | B0 e Boek B Ehasta Mo, tar, Rs. 27,17,5561- (Rupces | Eamest Money Deposit (EMD)
, Ninetv Eiht. Onl Bid Increase Amount : 0 F, vinar, nac wenty Seven La Rs.1,98,600/- (Rupees One

91922?) Five Thousand Only) inety Eight Only) Hundred Only) (Prospect No | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty | and Village Loni, Tensil and Dist: Ghaziabad, Seventeen Thousand Five | Lakh Ninety Eight Thousand
1. Mr. Vinod 16-May-2022 All that part and parcel of the property Shop 18-Oct-2022 Rs. 11,63,000/- IL10048580) Five Thousand Only) Uttar Pradesh, India, 201102. Hundred Fifty Six Only) Six Hundred Only)

Kumar Rs. 15,82,053/- (Rupees |On Second Floor Without Roof Rights, | Total Outstanding as On | (Rupees Eleven Lakh Sixty - — Y

2.Mrs.Usha Fifteen Lakh Eighty Two  |Admeasuring 6.13 Sq. Mts., "said shop" part|  Date 03-May-2024 Three Thousand Only) 1.Mr. Monu |20-Oct-2022 & Rs. 23,10,198/- | Al that part and parcel of the property bearing 25-Nov-2023 | Rs.20,02,000/-
(Prospect No | Thousand Fifty Three Only) |of Property No. 1/340, 140 Sq. Yds. Ward No. | Rs. 24,05,926/- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit | 2. Mrs.Pinkey | (Rupees Twenty Three Lakh |Flat No.C-546 B, 2Nd Floor Without RooffTotal Qutstanding as on | (Rupees Twenty Lakh Two
857794, Bid Increase Amount |1, Gali Rajan Khurd, Punja Sharif, Durga| Twenty Four Lakh Five |(EMD) Rs.1,16,300/-(Rupees| ~ Chauhan ~ | Ten Thousand One Hundred |Rights Area Admeasuirng 357 Sq.FtBuilt Up| " pate 03-May-2024 Thousand Only)
943646) Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty |Motor Market, , Kashmere Gate, Delhi-110006 | Thousand Nine Hundred | One Lakh Sixteen Thousand Ninety Eight Only) Area, C-Block, Sector 8 THA, Lig | Rs.29,69,522/- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit
Five Thousand Only) India. And Twenty Six Only) Three Hundred Only) (Prospect No Bid Increase Amount ?gfgi%bad, Ghaziabad, Uttar Pradesh, India,| Twenty Nine Lakh Sixty (EMD)

1. Mr. Guru Dutt|2-Feb-2022 & Rs.12,42,2341 | All that part and parcel of the property Property 01-Nov-2023 Rs. 8,98,000/- IL10032582) | Rs.25,000)- (Rupees Twenty ' Nine Thousand Five | Rs. 2,00,200/- (Rupees Two
2. Mrs.Rajesh | (Rupees Twelve Lakh Forty |bearing No. 11, admeasuring 100 Sq. Yds.,| Total Outstanding as On | (Rupees Eight Lakh Ninety Five Thousand Only) Hundred Twenty Two Only)] Lakh Two Hundred Only)
Devi Two Thousand Two Hundred |Khasra No. 309, Khurana Enclave, Pooja Date 03-May-2024 Eight Thousand Only) 1. Mr. Subhash |07-Sep-2022 & Rs.10,56,955/- | All that part and parcel of the property bearing 13-Feb-2023 Rs. 7,59,000/-

Thirty Four Only) Colony  Phase-ll,  Block-B, Village Rs. 17,52,024/- Earnest Money Deposit Chandra (Rupees Ten Lakh Fifty Six | Flat No-310, 3Rd Floor, admeasuring 301 Sq.Total Outstanding as On | (Rupees Seven Lakh Fifty
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount | Pavisadakpur, Pargana Loni, Tehsil Distt.| (Rupees Seventeen Lakh |(EMD) Rs. 89,800/- (Rupees| Kesarwani | Thousand Nine Hundred Fifty |Ft., Block-H, Sector-4, Rohini, North West| " pate 03-May-2024 Nine Thousand Only)
863210) Rs.20,_(|}£0/- (Rlépge? ;I'wenty Ghaziabad (U.P.)(Built up area 620 sq. ft.) FiftTy TW? Tgous%wdl A)nd Eighty II-\lIin% Trzjo(u)selm)d Eight| 2. Mrs.Meera Five Only) Delhi, Delhi, India, 110085 Rs. 14,90,268/- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)
ousand Only wenty Four Only undred Only Kesarwani Bid Increase Amount Fourteen Lakh Ninety Rs.75,900/- (Rupees
1. Mr. Krishan _|12-Apr-2023 & Rs.11,09,882/- | All that part & parcel of the property Flat No-G- 25-Nov-2023 Rs.10,08,000/- (Prospect No | Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty Thousand Two Hundred | Seventy Five Thousand
Kumar Tyagi | (Rupees Eleven Lakh Nine |1, Built Up Area Ad Measuring 400 Sq. Ft, [Total Outstanding as On| (Rupees Ten Lakh Eight 1L10023459) Thousand Only) Sixty Eight Only) Nine Hundred Only)
2. Mrs. Shilpa Thmljzgarr]]td I%|ght£h|mdred garpe}“ g\rﬁ\ Ad Meas#gg% 4§10 Sth. Ft. ang Lang Date 03-May-2024 Thousand Only) 1.Mr. Arun  |19-Dec-2022 & Rs.23,73,842/- | Al that part and parcel of the property bearing 05-Aug-2023 Rs. 20,20,000/-
Tyagi Eighty Two nly) réa Ad Measuring q. L, on Lroun Rs. 16,22,452/- Earnest Money Deposit Kumar (Rupees Twenty Three Lakh |Plot No.A-64/A, 3rd Floor, Back Side, Carpet|Total Qutstanding as On| _(Rupees Twenty Lakh
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount | floor, without roof right, constructed on Plot No. | - (Rupees Sixteen Lakh . y Hep 2 MrsRadha | Seventy Three Thousand |area admeasuring 405 Sq. Ft., Super Builtupl  pate 03-May-2024 Twenty Thousand Only)
863411 & | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty |B-1/34 situated at Residential Colony DIf dilshad | - Twenty Two Thousand (F(QEMe%)s' (R)ﬁ;[gghsg?/-ht " Devi Eight Hundred Forty Two only) | area admeasuring 450 Sq. Ft., Rhs, Kumaon| Rs. 2852 911 l-y(Rupees Earnest Money Deposit
918105) Five Thousand Only) ~ |Ext No. 2, Village Brahmpur, Alias Bhopura, | Four Hundred Fifty Two P g 3. Mrs.Sunita Bidl Amount | Sauare, West Vinod Kumar, East Delhi, Delhi,| Twenty Eight Lakh Fift EMD
Ghaziabad, 124008, Uttar Pradesh, India Onl Hundred Only) b Id “ncrease Amount | St 0000 y =19 ity (EMD)
) ) ) nly) (Prospect No | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty | !Ndia, . Two Thousand Nine Rs. 2,02,000/- (Rupees Two
1. Mr. Ramvir 2&(3&0ct-202% & R;s.g4,90|:4%1- All that part and parcel of the property bearing 11-Aug-2023 R Rs.T20,49,0|E)0l£;1 : 1L10021281) Five Thousand Only) (Land Area ad Measuring 1800 Sq. Ft.) | Hundred Eleven Only) Lakh Two Thousand Only)
Singh upees Twenty Four La Flat No - Ff-3, (Rear Side Without Roof Rights) | Total Outstanding as On upees Twenty Lakh Forty M 2 Allthat part and [ofth Tty beari Dec.
) ! , M 0-Aug-2022 at part and parcel of the property bearing 28-Dec-2022 Rs. 30,59,000/-
2. Mrs.Rekha Ninety Thousand Four , Carpet area admeasuring 500 Sq. Ft., 1st|  Date 04-Jun-2024 Nine Thousand Only) | Gurcharan Singh [Rs. 30,37 003/_g (Rupees Thirty | Entire First Floor, Built on Southern Portion[Total Qutstanding as on| (Rupees Thirty Lakh Fifty
Hundred Twenty Seven Only) |Floor Plot No - 1/762, Sec-1, Vasundhara,| Rs. 28,72,313/- (Rupees [Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)| 5 ‘\irs Amrit. | Lakh Thirty Seven Thousand |Area Measuring 75 Sq.Yds., of Built Up|  Date 03-May-2024 Nine Thousand Only)
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount Ghaziabad, ~Ghaziabad, 201012, Uttar|Twenty Eight Lakh Seventy | Rs.2,04,900/- (Rupees Two " KA i Property Bearing No.Wz-48a, Having Plot y | :
_ ,04, , Kaur Six Only) perty b g , naving Rs. 44,27,108/- Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)
900611) Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty |Pradesh, India Two Thousand Three Lakh Four Thousand Nine (Prospect No Bid1 A n No.179, Built On Land Area Measuring 150 Sq. (Rupees Forty Four Lakh |Rs.3,05,900/- (R Th
Five Thousand Only) (Area admeasuring 538 sq. ft.) Hundred Thirteen Only) Hundred Only) 833197) Rs '40 Sgaiaf;up;gu;‘ony Yds., out of Khasra No.16/5, Situated In The Twepnty Sevez Thousand ialéh Five T-h(ouuS[;en%sNinreee
1. Mr. Ishwar |08-Sep-2022 & Rs.12,14,964/- | Al that part and parcel of the property bearing 23-Jun-2023 Rs. 15,32,000/- " Thousand Only) Area of Village Keshopur, Colony Known As| one Hundred Eight Only) Hundred Only)
Chand Jana (Rupees Twelve Lakh Flat Bearing Pvt, No.1, 1st Floor, Without Roof [ Total Outstanding as On |(Rupees Fifteen Lakh Thirty Guru Nanak Nagar, Gall N0.5, New Delhi, India
2. Mrs. Anita Fourteen Thousand Nine | Rights, admeasuring 450 Sq. Ft., In Built-Up|  Date 03-May-2024 Two Thousand Only) 15-Jun-2021 & Rs.17,90,817/- | All that part and parcel of the property Plot No- 20-Dec-2022 Rs. 27,76,000/- (Rupees
Jana Hundred Sixty Four Only) _|Property Bearing MCD No. 769, W.No.6, Out| Rs. 18,49,779/- (Rupees |Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)| 1 wMr Naresh | (Rupees Seventeen Lakh |5, admeasuring 41.80 sq. mtrs. , UGF , Om|Totai Outstanding as on| Twenty Seven Lakh Seventy
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount | Of Khasra No. 1151 3 Min, Situated In The| Eighteen Lakh Forty Nine | Rs.1,53,200/- (Rupees One | 2 Mrs Soniya Ninety Thousand Eight | Vihar, Ph-3 Extn , Uttam Nagar , Pincode: " pate 03-May-2024 Six Thousand Only)
906591) Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty Abadi, Of Lal Dora, Village Mehrauli Tehsil| Thousand Seven Hundred | Lakh Fifty Three Thousand (prosp'ect No | Hundred Seventeen Only) | 110059, Delhi, India Rs.24,65,662/- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit (ENID)
Five Thousand Only) Hauz Khas, Delhi, India-110030. Seventy Nine Only) Two Hundred Only) 826774) Bid Increase Amount Twenty Four Lakh Sixty Rs. 2,77,600/- (Rupees Two

1 Mr. Deepak |02:Mar-2022 & Rs.18,52,168/- | All that part and parcel of the property Flat No 02-Jun-2023 Rs.18,63,000- Rs. 40,000/ (Rupees Forty |(Saleable Area 405 Sq. Ft.) Five Thousand Six Hundred | Lakh Seventy Seven Thousand

: Késhyapp %Rup%e]zs Elghéegn Lilkh (ljlfty(/j E/I/IE 061 okn ijround Floc?r on Dll?lxt il(\lo ,{k/-ﬁ/& Total Outstanding as On (Ru_;lgﬁes Ellghteen I(fél)(h| S)lxty Thousand Only) And Sixty Two Only) Six Hundred Only)
wo Thousand One Hundre ack side situated at nkur Vihar, Date 03-May-2024 ree 1housanda Unly o Jul- 3

(I2°} cﬂrsé,\cl:(tewo Sixty Eight Only) Loni, Ghaziabad, 201102, Uttar Pradesh, India| Rs. 31,10,586/- (Rupees |Earnest Money Deposit (EMD) 1. Mr. Dimpi 0(7§Ma;gso%?vétRsT'ﬁfé?é%/' égﬁggtt R?ga&4%%m§éO{:tthesplzggfréﬁtlﬁy OAFrLZé de 2-023 |W§§{21c’)?%(|)_g?(lh (F%L,ftpe%s ht

910623 820740)| __ Bid Increase Amount | admeasuring 700 Sg. eet . Thiry One Lakh Ten | Rs.1,86,3001- (Rupees One | % e~ finstna | (2 HEes Iy e [522'Sq. Ft, Plot No 2,3 10, Khasara No 510| 1 pate o8 Mogoms O | “Thousand Only)
! Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty Thousand Five Hundred | Lakh Eighty Six Thousand | " e Fed Ni 511, Shakt Enclave, Burari, North, North West| Rs. 30.24.9621 | ;

- : - Kumar Hundred Ninety Four Only) . _cnclave, ) ) €Sl Rs. 30,24,962/- (Rupees |Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)

Five Thousand Only) And Eighty Six Only) Three Hundred Only) Bid increase Amount | Delhi. Delhi India-110084 (Area admeasuring| Thirty [ akh Twenty Four | Rs.214.800/- (Rupees Two

1. Mr. Harendra | 30-Jul-2021 & Rs.22,05,272/- | All that part and parcel of the property No. MM- 09-Dec-2023 Rs. 19,88,000/- (Prospect No | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty | 432 S9. ft., Built up area admeasuring 540 sq.| Thousand Nine Hundred | ~Lakh Fourteen Tﬁousand

Malik (Rupees Twenty Two Lakh |74, Ugf-4, Rhs, admeasuring 51.09 Sq. mtr. , [ Total Outstanding as On | _ (Rupees Nineteen Lakh 784267) “Five Thousand Only) | t- and Saleable area admeasuring 405 sq. ft.) Sixty Two Only) Eight Hundred Only)

2. Mrs.Renuka | Five Thousand Two Hundred |Back Side, DIf, Ankur Vihar, Loni, Ghaziabad, Date 03-May-2024 Eighty Eight Thousand Only) — -

3.Mr. Ram Seventy Two Only) | Pincode:201102, Uttar Pradesh, India Rs.27,54,696)- (Rupees ~[Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)| - Mr. Amit | 12-Sep-2022 & Rs.13,90,2891- 2l that part and parcel of the property FlatNo-| ___01-July-2023 Rs. 11,54,0001
 Tomar Bid Increase Amount . ’ ’ Twenty Seven LakhpFifty lg;n‘f s98 soon;l)_l (F?l?g:és(One) Kumar (Rupees Thirteen Lakh Ninety | 35, 4th Floor, admeasuring 395 Sq. Ft., BIoCk-[Total Outstanding as on | (Rupees Eleven Lakn Fifty
(Prospect No | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty Four Thousand Six Hundred | Lakh Ninety Eight Thousand | 2 Mrs. Monika | Thousand Tiwo Hundred Eighty | -3, Ft =, -G DDA Flat, Narela, New Deli, - _ Date 03-May.2024 Four Thousand Only)
920139, 797148)|  Five Thousand Only) And Ninety Six Only) Eight Hundred Only) (Prospect No — Nine nlx) t gg\-lg,é%ﬁ%/& rﬁ’t\:\f)een?/ E;rnfs‘ltsM:Jl&y ?ngosﬂ (IE_)MD)
T Mr._Sunl__|10-Mar-2022 & Rs.18,79,931]- | AT that part and parcel of the property Enfire 20-Nov-2023 Rs. 17,29,000/- : wncrease AMOUMt | Carpet area admeasuring 284 sq. ft., Super| - =. S I nupees e

Kumar (Rupees Eighteen Lakh  |Upper Ground Floor Without Its RooffTerrace[ ™ Total Outstanding (Rupees Seventeen Lakh 729678) RS'ZF@OO.I(-’({ (Rupzeg 'I}wenty {)uiltpup area admeasl:u!in% 355 sqq. ft. P HunEilr%rc]jt ghlgc?r?arllldinzwgnl ) i F;flteeg TQ 0Cl)ysland o
2. Mrs.Indra | Seventy Nine Thousand Nine |Rights Out Of Built-Up Property Bearing No.Rz- as On Date Twenty Nine Thousand Only) ive Thousand Only) y y undred Only)
(Prospect No | Hundred Thirty One Only) 1299 (Old No.Rz-1-2), In Gall NO.5 (Main), Area 03-May-2024 Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)| 1. Mr. Arvind ~ [16-Jan-2023 & Rs.34,53,823/- | Al that part and parcel of the property Plot No 01-Nov-2023 Rs.32,40,000/-

908549, Bid Increase Amount | Measuring 58 Sq. Yds. |.E.48.5 Sq. Mtr., Part Of| Rs, 24,12,173/- (Rupees | Rs.1,72,900/- (Rupees One Kumar (Rupees Thirty Four Lakh Fifty {213 Third Floor With Roof Rights, Back Side Total Outstanding as On| (Rupees Thirty Two Lakh

952527) Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty |Khasra NO.12 14, Situated In Revenue Estate | Tienty Four Lakh Twelve |Lakh Seventy Two Thousand| 2. Mrs. Jaishree | Three Thousand Eight Hundred | Flat No 7, Land area measuring 100 sq. yds .| Date 03-May-2024 Forty Thousand Only)

Five Thousand Only) | Of Village Sagarpur, Delhi State Delhi, Colony| Thousand One Hundred Nine Hundred Only) (Prospect No | and Twenty Three Only) | Super built up area admeasuring 900 sq. .| Rs, 41,24,380/- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)
Known As West Sagarpur, New Delhi-| And Seventy Three Only) 856405 & Bid Increase Amount | Out Of Khasra No. 156, situated in the rev-| Forty One Lakh Twenty Rs. 3,24,000/- (Rupees
| 110046 India (Area admeasuring 470 sq. ft.) 958709) Rs.40,000/- (Rupees Forty | #hue estate OfDVl"r']?gﬁ 8‘35”96"5’%-"’}” dGarde”’ Four Thousand Three | Three Lakh Twenty Four
1. Mr. Rinku |21-Sep-2022 & Rs.9,51,482/- |All that part & parcel of the property bearing Entire 09-Jun-2023 Rs.7,71,000/- (Rupees Thousand Only) 8 Tagar, e e . Hundred Eighty Only) Thousand Only)

Gupta (Rupees Nine Lakh Fifty One |Ground Floor, Without Roof Rights,Land Area Ad|Total Outstanding As On| Seven Lakh Seventy One i 06-Jul-2023 All that part and parcel of the property Upper,  Date of Possession Rs.20,60,000/-

2. Ishant Sticker | Thousand Four Hundred  |Measuring 248 Sq.Ft, and Carpet Area Ad|  Date 03-May-2024 Thousand Only) 1 '\éf(-)l aSrﬁ(ri”ay Rs. 23.77.074- (Rupees | Ground Floor without  roofltertace rights il I ebons Twart Lakh Sity
3. Mrs.Santosh Eighty Two Only) Measuring 241 Sq.Ft., on Property Bearing No. 2075 Rs. 13,11,041/- Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)| 2 s Guddi | Twenty Three Lakh Seventy |towards back side of built-up property bearing -Jet d Thousand Only)
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount |(Pvt No.15), Ward No. XII Situated At Mukimpura, | - (Rupees Thirteen Lakh Rs. 77,100/- (Rupees " Seervi Seven Thousand Seventy [Plot ~ No. 67 And 68, Carpet area| Total Outstanding as on Earnest Monev Deposit

937203 and | Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty (Subzi Mandi, New Delni, 110007, Delni, India.| Eleven Thousand Forty | Seventy Seven Thousand | 3 wr. Sachin Three Only) Ad.Measuring: 383 Sq.ft, Built up area)  Date 03-May-2024 EMDy P

939868) Thousand Only) |( Built Up Area ad Measuring 224 Sq. Ft) One Only) One Hundred Only) o : Ad Measuring: 480 Sa.f, KhNo.59/6, Stuated| ~ Rs 2600830 | o) e (fEMD)
1.Mr. Anand |19-Oct-2022 & Rs.25,86,810/- | All that part and parcel of the property bearing | 03-Jun-2023 | Rs.23,49,000/- (Rupees (Prospect No R gydgglreaRse AmoTunt t in the revenue estate of Village Hastsal in EI?ufﬁeﬁSrLV::St'lxhsi:tx Ll\?ilrig Lakh Six Thousard Only)

Kumar (Rupees Twenty Five Lakh  |Prop No- C-4/172, Admeasurimg Land Area [Total Outstanding As On| Twenty Three Lakh Forty 1L10229852) $.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty f colony known as Mohan Garden in Block-L-1,| EI9 onl y

2. Mrs.Rubi Eighty Six Thousand Eight 341 Sq. Ft., Carpet Area 270 Sq Ft., Built Up|  Date 03-May-2024 Nine Thousand Only) Five Thousand Only) Uttam Nagar New Delhi 110059 nly)

Anand Hundred Ten Only) Area 298 Sq. Ft,, 3Rd Floor, Pkt C-4, Sector-| Rs. 33,84,040/- (Rupees |Eamest Money Deposit (EMD)| , ... [16-Nov-2022 & Rs.34,37,231]. | All that part and parcel of the property bearing 27-Jan-2023 Rs. 28,19,000/-
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount |6, Rohini, New Delhi, India, 110039 Thirty Three Lakh Eighty | Rs. 2,34,900/- (Rupees Two | ' Mrll ,\;laFt’ an | (Rupees Thirty Four Lakh  |Plot No. 63 Khasra No. 642, AreaTotal Outstanding as on | (Rupees Twenty Eight Lakh
"|-L110(?g7286g976)& Rs. |2:'5’00T0r<- (Rupgeos Tlv;enty (Saleable Area ad Measuring 307 Sq. Ft.) |Four Thousand Forty Only) Lak,t}lThiIr_'ty FdouEj Trémfs)and 5 M Sgigtras Tginya S?jv'?ﬂ'r-lt-h%mang le)o éﬂams%amljirml\%l a1u?§1MSa\qHEIti'RI'\AKétELTrr:mZg%)(l)%qy Date 03-May-2024 Nineteen Thousand Only)

ive Thousand Only ine Hundred Only Prospect No. undred Thirty One Only -, : ; : '| Rs. 43,13,067/- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)
T, Mukesh [26-9u-2022 & R 25,30,132I-| All it part and parcel of the property bearing|___ 17-Jun2023 | Rs.21,78,000% (Rupees | | 880369) Bid Increase Amount ?Sthafeﬁriﬁ?ﬁhd'”cgfea admeasuring 2106 sq.| Oy Three Lakh Thirteen | Rs.2,81,9001- (Rupees Two
Kumar (Rupees Twenty Five Lakh |Flat No. 02, Ground Floor, admeasuring 48| Total Outstanding as | Twenty One Lakh Seventy Rs.40,000/- (Rupees Forty ft) P P g 9| Thousand Sixty Seven | Lakh Eighty One Thousand
2. Mrs. Manju | Thirty Thousand One Hundred |Sq. Mirs., Piot No J-54, Sec-12, Pratap Vihar,| On Date 03-May-2024 | _Eight Thousand Only) Thousand Only) : Only) Nine Hundred Only)
Rani Thirty Two Only) Ghaziabad, Uttar Pradesh, India-201009 Rs. 34,30,227/- (Rupees |Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)| 1. Mr.Rajeev | 12-Jul-2022 & Rs.13,58,969/- | All that part and parcel of the propertyn .H No- 22-Nov-2022 Rs. 11,64,000/-
Bid Increase Amount Thirty Four Lakh Thirty | Rs.2,17,800/- (Rupees Two | 2.Mrs.Mamta | (Rupees Thirteen Lakh Fifty |E-589-B,EWSFirst Floor,Area admeasuring|Total Outstanding as On | (Rupees Eleven Lakh Sixty
(Prospect No. | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty |(Area admeasuring 517 sq. ft.) Thousand Two Hundred | Lakh Seventeen Thousand Eight Thousand Nine Hundred | 13.65 sq.mtr With Roof rights, Block E ,Sector| " pate 03-May-2024 Four Thousand Only)
1L10045037) Five Thousand Only) Twenty Seven Only) Eight Hundred Only) Sixty Nine Only) 11, Pratap Vihar Ghaziabad Uttar Pradesh,| Rs, 17,60,924/- (Rupees |Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)
1. Mrs. Deepa 02-Sep-2021 & All that part and parcel of the property Prop 13-Dec-2022 Rs.16,73,000/- (Rupees | (Prospect No Bid Increase Amount | 201102 ,India Seventeen Lakh Sixty | Rs.1,16,400/- (Rupees One
2.Mr.Ravi Kumar L R:.14,1LO,l?r?9|_/- (Rl_trl]pees ’ No- 35, 1St Floor, Area Admeasuring 50 Sg.| Total Outstanding as On | Sixteen Lakh Seventy Three 918886, 814421) Rs.2F$,00%I]- (Rupcée(s5 le)enty TAho(;JsTand {\llr;:e Hugdlre)d Lakh Siﬁteedn Tdh%usia)nd Four
ourteen Lakh len Thousand |Yds., Khasra No- 457, Village Nawada Majra|  Date 03-May-2024 Thousand Only) ive Thousand Only nd Twenty Four Only undred Only
Nine Hundred Eighty Only) |Hastal, Block- A, Mohan Garden, Uttam| Rs. 15,95,678/- (Rupees [Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)| 1. Mr. Satish |25-Jun-2022 & Rs.22,74,890/-| All that part and parcel of the property Flat] 22-Sep-2023 Rs. 16,81,000/- (Rupees
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount|Nagar, West Delhi, Delhi, India, 110059 Fifteen Lakh Ninety Five | Rs.1,67,300/- (Rupees One Kumar (Rupees Twenty Two Lakh [No.Sf -03,2Nd _Floor Front ~LHS,Area[Total Outstanding as On| Sixteen Lakh Eighty One
IL10045364) | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty |(Carpet are 360 sq. ft., Built up area 405 sq. | Thousand Six Hundred And | Lakh Sixty Seven Thousand | 2. Mrs.Jyoti | Seventy Four Thousand Eight | Admeasuring 53.75 Sq.Yards, Plot No D14 ™ pate 03-May-2024 Thousand Only)
Five Thousand Only) ft.) Seventy Eight Only) Three Hundred Only) Kumari Hundred Ninety Only) And D15, Khasra No157b Sai Upvan Vill-| Rs 3153 457/- (Rupees |Earnest Money Deposit (ENID)
1.Mr. Ashu | 30-Jul-2022 & Rs.25,11,392/- | All that part and parcel of the property bearing 07-Jan-2023 Rs.21,02,000/- (Prospect No Bid Increase Amount | {usufpur, Chaksberitehsil Dadri, , G B Nagar,| Thirty One Lakh Fifty Three | Rs.1,68,100/- (Rupees One
Chauhan (Rupees Twenty Five Lakh | P-124, Block-P, Area admeasuring 50 Sq. Yds. [ Total Outstanding as On | (Rupees Twenty One Lakh |920467, 823718)| Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty | Greater Noida, 201308, Uttar Pradesh, India | Thousand Four Hundred | Lakh Sixty Eight Thousand
2. Mrs.Poonam HElijverc]j Lhoutsa?d Tgele | Second Floor, Front Right hand side, Pvt Plot| ~ Date 03-May-2024 Two Thousand Only) Five Thousand Only) And Fifty Seven Only) One Hundred Only)
unared Ninety Iwo Only ) |No-1208, Mohan Garden, Village- Razapur| Rs. 29,82,655/- (Rupees |Earnest Money Deposit (EMD i i -Jan- -
(It:%i%igtﬁ gl)o Bid Increase Amount | Khurd Uttam Nagar, New Delhi-110059 ngrnty ¥Lne Lakg gighty Rs.2,10,200/¥ (Rgpees(Two) 1'2MR}|F§.aJBE:gL:Ja Rs 272(?5.‘]3%'6%.0 (ngupees élcinmwaetrcgalrbningeaa?r:;el\lloOfGlt!jgﬁ p;céﬁ]eerg Total o(zﬁs\:::d?:gs as on (RupeEZITﬁél?Qogglljr Lakh
Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty wo Thousand Six Lakh Ten Thousand Two | Bhushan Bajaj Twenty S : . ' ’ Sixteen Th d Onl
. - y Seven Lakh Five [suring 305 Sq. Ft. Super area, on Ground|  Date 03-May-2024 | oixteen fhousand Un y)
Five Thousand Only) . Hundred Fifty Five Only) Hundred Only) 3.Mrs.Indu Bala | - Thousand Six Hundred | Floor, in the Shopping Mall named "Parsvnath Rs. 38,20,489/- Earnest Money Deposit
1. Mr. Rahul |24-Nov-2022 & Rs.12,01,377/- | All that part and parcel of the property bearing 18-July-2023 Rs.16,91,000/- (Rupees | 4. M/S Western Ninety Nine Only) Cit Mall" Situated at Shopping Mall beingl (Rupees Thirty Eight Lakh (EMD)

Birla (Rupees Twelve Lakh One | Flat No.11, Admeasuring Area 514 Sq. Ft., 4th| Total Outstanding as Sixteen Lakh Ninety One Gallery, 5.Mrs. iy Mall’, situated at shopping Mall being Twenty Thousand Four | ps 2 41.600/- (R T
2.Mrs.Pooja | Thousand Three Hundred |Floor, Pocket-1A, Block-A4, Sector-A1-4,| On Date 03-May-2024 Thousand Only) Shanti Bajaj Bid Increase Amount | Site No3, Sector-12, Tehsil Badkhal, 1y ndreq And Eighty Nine | R 241,600/ (Rupees Two
3. Rudrash Seventy Seven Only) ~|Narela, New Delhi-110040 Rs. 16,27,801/- (Rupees |Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)| (Prospect No | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty | Faridabad, Haryana, 121003, India. Only) Lakh Forty One Thousand

Cammication Bid Increase Amount ( t o Sixteen Lakh Twenty | Rs.1,69,100/- (Rupees One | 913786, 939477) Five Thousand Only) Six Hundred Only)
(Prospect No. | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty |(carpet area:- 411 sq. ft. Seven Thousand Eight | Lakh Sixty Nine Thousand _Jul- i i .
IL10111684) Five Thousand Only) Hundred One Only) One Hundred Only) §|M;rh'\lZrel\s/lrr1 Rs. 26‘!22‘,];: 221?%Ilupees él‘thhatA%adrt agg?)p,arc:rlec;f th(ranre);ospuerﬁ]nglo;é\lgod Syml;;l-lgz?zsos;sswn (Rupsess: ?’g;?tg’&?r?é Lakh
25-Jan-2023 & Rs.22,35,134/- | All that part and parcel of the property H.No- 28-Jun-2023 Rs.18,62,000/- Madanlal, 3. | Twenty Six Lakh Sixty Two |sq.ft.,Anandvan Phase-li, Khasra No. 200, = Forty Thousand Only)
1. Mrs. Nagma | (Rupees Twenty Two Lakh 14700, Carpet Area 421 sq. ft., Super Built-Up [Total Outstanding as On |(Rupees Eighteen Lakh Sixty | Naresh Engin - |  Thousand Six Hundred ~ [Mauja Nawada, Mathura, 281006, Uttar|Total Outstanding As On} :
2. MIr. Mohd Aakil| Thirty Five Thousand One ~ |Area 495 sq. ft., Kh.No-117110/2Entire First|  Date 03-May-2024 Two Thousand Only) eering, 4. Mr. Twelve Only ) Pradesh R D§§9083{!\,"ﬂy'(%{024 Earnest IXIEOI\;I]S¥ Deposit
Prospect No | Hundred Thirty Four Only) | Floor, Without Roof Right, Village Burari, Gali| s, 28,65,549/- (Rupees |Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)| _ Pratap Singh - $. £6,09,174[- (nupees
70%5057) | BidTnorease Amount —|No-112 B-Block. Sant Nagar Burari Delic| Tuent) Elnt Lok Gy | B a6 o001, (hepone One | 5. M. S it | Bid Inrease Amount Twenty Eight Lakh fine | - Rs. 394,100 (Rupees
Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty | 110084 (Area admeasuring 396 sq. ft. and| Five Thousand Five = | Lakh Eighty Six Thousand | (Prospect No | Rs. 40,000/- (Rupees Forty Thousand One Hundred | - Throe Lakh Ninety Four
Five Thousand Only) | saleable area admeasuring 446 sq. ft) | Hundred Forty Nine Only) | Two Hundred Only) 880312) Thousand Only) And Seventy Four Only) Thousand Only)

1. Mr. Avinash 28-Sep-2022 | All'that part and parcel of the property bearing|  16-Mar-2023 Rs.18,72,000/- (Rupees | 1. Mr. Sushil [17-May-2023 & Rs.18,38,276/-| All that part and parcel of the property Land| 26-Jul-203 Rs.15,84,000/- (Rupees

Kumar Rs. 16,01,840/- (Rupees | Flat bearing Pvt. n0.06, (Unit No 57)  built-up [ Total Outstanding as On | Eighteen Lakh Seventy Two Kumar (Rupees Eighteen Lakh | khata no 1365, khasra no. 1917/3min, LandTotal Outstanding As On| Fifteen Lakh Eighty Four
2. Mrs.Jai Devi | Sixteen Lakh One Thousand |area admeasuring 675 sq. ft., 2nd floor without| Date 03-May-2024 Thousand Only) 2. Mrs. Rajesh | Thirty Eight Thousand Two [Area 1100 sq. ft., CarpetArea 770 sq. ft, Built| ** pate 03-May-2024 | Thousand Only)
3.Mrs.Meena | Eight Hundred Forty Only) [roof rights,built up on out of Khasra| Rs.21,85,962/- (Rupees [Earnest Money Deposit (ENID) Devi Hundred Seventy Six Only) | UpArea 800 sq. ft, situated in Mauja Archedia Rs. 20,99,649/- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit (END)

Devi Bid Increase Amount | N0-844(min), Burari, Lal Dora Burari, North| Twenty One Lakh Eighty | Rs.1,87,200/- (Rupees One | (Prospect No Bid Increase Amount CD%irsatntb grg%dﬁgr&rt];rapkﬂagﬁgaln*é;‘ndzrhysaf%on, Twenty Lakh Ninety Nine | Rs.1,58,400/- (Rupees One
(Prospect No | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty |Delhi, Delhi, India, 110084 Five Thousand Nine ~  [Lakh Eighty Seven Thousand| [L10222783) | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty | = ! e Thousand Six Hundred | Lakh Fifty Eight Thousand
IL10169657) Five Thousand Only) Hundred Sixty Two Only) Two Hundred Only) Five Thousand Only) Forty Nine Only) Four Hundred Only)

1. Mr. Rupesh [19-Oct-2022 & Rs.24,28,430/- | All that part and parcel of the property bearing 09-Feb-2024 Rs.19,69,000/- Date of Inspection of property EMD Last Date Date/ Time of E-Auction
Tiwari T(RupteeE'Tr\:\{eant]y FourdLEkh glot IL\![O-GIJIAi ﬁdng;ungnlgdCarpet FAreat ﬁﬁS Total Outstanding as On |(Rupees Nineteen Lakh Sixty 24-Jun-2024 1100 hrs -1400 hrs | 26-Jun-2024 {ill 5 pm. 28-Jun-2024 1100 hrs-1300 hrs.
2. A%Lﬁigaftl Welzl]umdrltgad Thirot;s%nnly) our (V(\Illith "Rgo?), &}t No)-,402 Kh%%rra r?\lr;_eeg Rs?g;%g%’&?_y('é%: es Earrll\:elgte M'I':r:)eusaDr;d cg;ll)(ll)EMD) Mode Qf Payment :- EMD payments are to be made vide online mode only. To make payments you have to visit https:/lwww. iiflonehome.com and pay through
(Prospect No BT Y T Village Nawada Uttam Nagar West Delhi-|Twentv Nine Lakh Sevent Rs.196 900Iy Rp 0 link available for the property/ Secured Asset only.
|L102%2879) R 2I5 O(r)‘glreaRse mo_lyn ty | 110059 Fivye Thousand Five y Ls.kﬁ Net S( gl%ees ”de Note: Payment link for each property/ Secured Asset is different. Ensure you are using link of the property/ Secured Asset you intend to buy vide public auc-
S Five Th ( upzeg lwen y (Built up area admeasuring 585 sq. ft. Hundred Four Only) a \i ml-(la yd IXd gulsan tion. For “balance payment, upon successful bid, has to pay through RTGS/NEFT. The accounts details are as follows: a) Name of the Account:- IIFL
: ive Thousand Only) y ine Hundred Only) | Home Finance Ltd., b) Name of the Bank:- Standard Chartered Bank, c) Account No:-9902879xxxxx followed by Prospect Number, d) IFSC Code:-
1. Mr. Sunil ~ [15-May-2023 & Rs.25,97,247I- | All that part and parcel of the property Plot No. 31-Oct-2023 Rs.22,12,000/- SCBL0036001, e) Bank Address: Standard Chartered Bank, 90 M.G. Road, Fort, Mumbai-400001.

Kumar (Rupees Twenty Five Lakh  126-A, Carpet Area 360 sq. ft., Super Built-Up [Total Outstanding as On | (Rupees Twenty Two Lakh -

2. Mrs. Rinku | Ninety Seven Thousand Two |Area 450 sq. ft., SF LHS ,Khasra No. 109/9,|  Date 03-May-2024 Twelve Thousand Only) o . . _ TERMS AND CONDITIONS:- . . ) .

Devi Hundred Forty Seven Only) |Block-A Village Palam Raja Puri Uttam Nagar, | Rs. 32,73,511)- (Rupees [Earnest Money Deposit (ENID) 1. For participating in e-auction, Intending bidders required to register their details with the Service Provider ht@pf://www. ||ron"ehome.c.om well in

P : advance and has to create the login account, login ID and password. Intending bidders have to submit / send their "Tender FORM" along with the pay-
Bid Increase Amount New Delhi- 110059 Thirty Two Lakh Seventy | Rs.2,21,200/- (Rupees Two . 4 )
3 i ment details towards EMD, copy of the KYC and PAN card at the above mentioned Branch Office.
(Prospect No | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty Three Thousand Five | Lakh Twenty One Thousand . . . . . . et " - . .
IL10233853) Five Thousand Only) Hundred Eleven Only) Two Hundred Only) 2. The bidders shall improve their offer in multiple of amount mentioned under the column "Bid Increase Amount". In case bid is placed in the last 5 min-
- 112-Aor-2023 & Rs.33 84,645/~ | All fhai part & Tofh & BTt U FF 14-0c1.2023 Rs.27 2 | utes of the closing time of the auction, the closing time will automatically get extended for 5 minutes.
1. Mr. Nikhil 'Rpr' A 'T'h o i at rpa j rﬁ)tam?bo ) € dprOpﬁ' yn ?lPrup p -Uct-2 R ST , 0%00 1 Lakn |3 The successful bidder should deposit 25% of the bid amount (after adjusting EMD) within 24 hours of the acceptance of bid price by the AQ and the balance 75%

_Kumar (E,“ﬁ?e‘; IT¥1 ree b "’S‘. ‘é";a;’iﬁ ﬁg_ é% AS |(3) iltaLCJ ir:a% y ;\%eaos rir?p$ 4%’ Total Outstanding as On |( L_f_peest _"r"ﬁ”ty edv%n I a of the bid amount within 15 days from the date of confirmation of sale by the secured creditor. All deposit and payment shall be in the prescribed mode of payment.

2. Miss. Deeksha| Eignty Four Ihousand Six 9 , Ul Up ieasuring Date 03-May-2024 wenty Thousand Only) {4 The purchaser has to bear the cess, applicable stamp duty, fees, and any other statutory dues or other dues like municipal tax, electricity charges, land

3. Mrs. Maya | Hundred Forty Five Only) Sqt. Fft-f(ﬁ”d Carpe;éieta /;g “g?%st”rggowz S?' dFt'i Rs. 37,84,513/- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)|  and all other incidental costs, charges including all taxes and rates outgoings relating to the property.
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount Silljlaoe Ng;/r:daoih the (?oloﬁ knO\CA)/n as s(.l)rl1j1a\;3ihaar Thirty Seven Lakh Eighty | Rs. 2,72,000/- (Rupees Two |5, Bidders are advised to go through the website https: /www.iiflonehome.com and https://www.iifl.com/nome-loans/properties-for-auction for detailed
IL10238776) | Rs.40,000/- (Rupees Forty P ag | Utiaon Naoor We);t Dol Indiar 110026 Four Thousand Five |Lakh Seventy Two Thousand|  terms and conditions of auction sale & auction application form before submitting their Bids for taking part in the e-auction sale proceedings.
Thousand Only) ’ gar, ,India, 119591 Hundred Thirteen Only) Only) 6. For details, help procedure and online training on e-auction prospective bidders may contact the service provider E mail ID:- care@iiflone-
1.Mr. Aman |27-Sep-2022 & Rs.17,66,541/- | All that part and parcel of the property bearing 26-Jul-2023 Rs.18,04,000/- home.com, Support Helpline no.1800 2672 499.
2. Mrs.Bharti (Rupees Seventeen Lakh | Plot No 29A And 30 A, admeasuring 540 sq.[Total Outstanding as On |(Rupees Eighteen Lakh Four |7. For any query related to Property details, Inspection of Property and Online bid etc. call IFL HFL toll free no.1800 2672 499 from 09:30 hrs
3. Mr.Ravinder | Sixty Six Thousand Five  |ft., Third Floor, Khaera No 38/10, Press| pate 03-May-2024 Thousand Only) to 18:00 hrs between Monday to Friday or write to email:- care@iiflonehome.com.
Singh _ Hundred Forty One Only)  |Enclave Part -Il, Vikas Nagar Uttam Nagar| Rs. 21,56,932/- (Rupees [Earnest Money Deposit (EMD){8. Notice is hereby given to above said borrowers to collect the household articles, which were lying in the secured asset at the time of taking physical

Further the notice is hereby given to the Borrower/s, that in case they fail to collect the above said articles same shall be sold in accordance with Law.
0. In case of default in payment at any stage by the successful bidder / auction purchaser within the above stipulated time, the sale will be cancelled and

1. AO reserves the rights to postpone/cancel or vary the terms and condition of tender/auction without assigning any reason thereof. In case of any dis-

Place:- New Delhi, Date: 07-June-2024

Sd/- Authorised Officer, |

IFL Home Finance Limited.

Form No. INC-26
[Pursuant to rule 30 the Companies
(Incorporation) Rules, 2014]
Advertisement to be published in the newspaper
for change of registered office of the company
from one state to another
Before the Central Government
NORTHERN REGION, New Delhi
In the matter of sub-section (4) of Section 13 of
Companies Act, 2013 and clause (a) of
sub-rule (5) of rule 30 of the Companies
(Incorporation) Rules, 2014  AND
In the matter of ZIPPAD REALTY PRIVATE
LIMITED having its registered office at
B-1/30 Ist Floor Janakpuri Delhi 110058
......... Petitioner
Notice
Notice is hereby given to the General Public that the
company proposes to make application to the
Central Government (Regional Director, Northern
Region)under section 13 of the Companies Act,
2013 seeking confirmation of alteration of the
Memorandum of Association of the Company in
terms of the special resolution passed at the Extra
Ordinary General meeting held on Monday, 3rd
June 2024to enable the company to change its
Registered office from the “National Capital Territory
Delhi"to “State of Haryana”.
Any person whose interest is likely to be affected by
the proposed change of the registered office of the
company may deliver either on the MCA-21 portal
(www.mca.gov.in) by filing investor complaint form
or cause to be delivered or send by registered post
of his/her objections supported by an affidavit
stating the nature of his/her interest and grounds of
opposition to the Regional Director, Northern
Region, at B-2 Wing, 2nd Floor, Pt. Deendayal
Antyodaya Bhawan, CGO Complex, New Delhi -
110003, within Fourteen days from the date of
publication of this notice with a copy to the applicant
company at its registered office at the address
mentioned below: Plot No. B-1/30 Ist Floor
Janakpuri Delhi 110058
For and Behalf of the Board of Directors
ZIPPAD REALTY PRIVATE LIMITED
Sd/-
DEEPAK TOMAR
(Director) DIN: 02484965
5 C-12, Block C, DLF Phase-l Gurugram,

Date: 07.06.2024: Place: New Delhi Haryana 122002

financialexp.epaprin

New Delhi

IN THE COURT OF SPECIAL SUB
COURT TO DEALS WITH MCOP CASES,

COIMBATORE
M.C.0O.P.No. 1416/2023

Sri Laxmi Traders,

Rep by its Partner Sachidanandam

Vs
Nithish Kumar @ Rithish

S/o. Rajvev Raj, AT-PO-Darwa, PS
Tajtur,Samastipur Dt, Bihar State.
.1st Respondent

NOTICE

The petitioner has filed the above case
against you for claiming compensation for
the vehicle damages of goods in a road
accident which took place on 09-11-2022.
The above case is posted on 10-07-2024 for

your appearance. If you

objection in the above case, you have to
appear in person or through your counsel on
the said date before the aforesaid Hon'ble
Courtat 10.30 am. Otherwise the petition will

be decided as prayed for.

N. THANGARAJ, B.Sc.B.L.,

K. SELVANAYAGAM, B.A., BL,
ADVOCATES
Thennampalayam, Tirupur-641 604.
Cell : 98426 60601, 93454 16751.

...Petitioner
Kumar,

have any valid

Form No. INC-26

{Pursuant to Rule 30 of the Companies
(Incorporation) Rules, 2014}

Before the Central Government,
Regional Director, Northern Region, New Delhi
In the matter of sub-section (4) of Section 13 of
Companies Act, 2013 and clause (a) of
sub-rule (5) of Rule 30 of the Companies
(Incorporation) Rules, 2014
AND

In the matter of

SANDHAR TOOLING PRIVATE LIMITED

(CIN: U28939DL2002PTC114374)

having its Registered Office at

B-6/20, L.S.C Safdarjung Enclave,
New Delhi-110029

......... Applicant Company / Petitioner
NOTICE is hereby given to the General Public
that the Applicant Company proposes to
make application to the Central Government
under Section 13(4) of the Companies Act,
2013 seeking confirmation of alteration of the
Memorandum of Association of the Company
in terms of the special resolution passed at the
Extra Ordinary General Meeting held on 29th
May 2024 to enable the Company to change
its Registered Office from "National Capital

Territory of Delhi (NCT)”
Haryana”.

Any person whose interest is likely to be
affected by the proposed change of the
registered office of the company may deliver

MCA-21
by filing
complaint form or cause to be  delivered or
send by registered post his /her objections
supported by an affidavit stating the nature of
his / her interest and grounds of opposition to
the Regional Director, Northern Region,
Ministry of Corporate Affairs, B-2 Wing, 2nd
Floor, Pt. Deendayal Antyodaya Bhawan, CGO
Complex, New Delhi-110003 within fourteen
(14) days from the date of publication of this
notice with a copy to the applicant Company

either on  the
(www.mca.gov.in)

at its Registered Office
mentioned below:-

B-6/20, L.S.C Safdarjung Enclave,

New Delhi-110029

SANDHAR TOOLING PRIVATE LIMITED

AJAY KUMAR RAGHAV

Date : 06.06.2024
Place : New Delhi

to the "State of

portal
investor

at the address

For & on behalf of
Sd/-

(DIRECTOR)
DIN : 09380468




